
 

 

A national webinar on THEATRE IN POST PANDEMIC ERA was 
organized by the department of Bengali on 26th August, 2020. 
Honorable speakers Subodh Patnaik and Debshankar Haldar 
graced the occasion. 
 

 

A three-day international webinar on BIOPOLITICS: LITERATURE, 
CULTURE AND SOCIETY was organized by the department of 
English on 23rd-25th July, 2020. Renowned academics from India 
and abroad graced the occasion.  
 

 

A two-day national webinar on SCOPE OF MATHEMATICAL 
MODELLING : THEORY TO APPLICATION was organized by the 
department of Mathematics on 30th-31st July, 2020. Honorable 
speakers Dr. Kripasindhu Chaudhuri, Dr. Sudeshna Banerjea and 
Dr. Priya Das graced the occasion.  
 

 

A one-day national webinar on INTERNAL DYNAMICS OF 
PAKISTAN AND ITS REFLECTION IN FOREIGN POLICY was 
organized by the department of Political Science on 22nd July, 
2020. Honorable speakers Dr. Sanchita Bhattacharya graced the 
event.  
 

 

State-level webinar on CAREER ADVANCEMENT SCHEME was 
organized by IQAC, KHALISANI MAHAVIDYALAYA on 22nd 
August, 2020. Prof. Tushar Kanti Ghara was the honorable 
speaker for the occasion.  
 

 

A one-day international webinar on URBAN DISPLACEMENT AND 
SUSTAINABLE DEVELOPMENT was organized by the 
department of Geography on 27th September, 2020. Honorable 
speakers Dr. Debangana Bose and Dr. Tapas Pal graced the 
occasion.  
 

 

PERIODIC LECTURE PROGRAMME ON DIFFERENT 
CONTEMPORARY PHILOSOPHICAL ISSUES was organized by the 
department of Philosophy on 14th December, 2021. Honorable 
speakers Prof. Sabujkoli Sen, Dr. Madhu Kapoor, Prof. Santosh 
Kumar Paul and Dr. Nirmal Kumar Roy graced the occasion.  
 


